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Feminism has hit the big time. Once a dirty word brushed away with a grimace, “feminist” has been
rebranded as a shiny label sported by movie and pop stars, fashion designers, and multi-hyphenate
powerhouses like Beyoncé. It drives advertising and marketing campaigns for everything from wireless plans
to underwear to perfume, presenting what’s long been a movement for social justice as just another consumer
choice in a vast market. Individual self-actualization is the goal, shopping more often than not the means,
and celebrities the mouthpieces.

But what does it mean when social change becomes a brand identity? Feminism’s splashy arrival at the
center of today’s media and pop-culture marketplace, after all, hasn’t offered solutions to the movement’s
unfinished business. Planned Parenthood is under sustained attack, women are still paid 77 percent—or
less—of the man’s dollar, and vicious attacks on women, both on- and offline, are utterly routine.

Andi Zeisler, a founding editor of Bitch Media, draws on more than twenty years’ experience interpreting
popular culture in this biting history of how feminism has been co-opted, watered down, and turned into a
gyratory media trend. Surveying movies, television, advertising, fashion, and more, Zeisler reveals a media
landscape brimming with the language of empowerment, but offering little in the way of transformational
change. Witty, fearless, and unflinching, We Were Feminists Once is the story of how we let this happen, and
how we can amplify feminism’s real purpose and power.
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From reader reviews:

Erin Weiss:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled We Were Feminists Once: From Riot Grrrl to
CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political Movement. Try to make book We Were Feminists Once:
From Riot Grrrl to CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political Movement as your friend. It means that
it can to get your friend when you truly feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than
ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you
can know anything by the book. So , we should make new experience and knowledge with this book.

William Powell:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive today, people have
do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by surrounding.
One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. That's why, by reading
a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand up than other is high. For you personally
who want to start reading any book, we give you this kind of We Were Feminists Once: From Riot Grrrl to
CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political Movement book as beginning and daily reading reserve.
Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Pierre Winter:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because if you find yourself reading a book particularly book
entitled We Were Feminists Once: From Riot Grrrl to CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political
Movement the mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in most aspect that maybe not
known for but surely might be your mind friends. Imaging each and every word written in a book then
become one contact form conclusion and explanation in which maybe you never get just before. The We
Were Feminists Once: From Riot Grrrl to CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political Movement
giving you an additional experience more than blown away your head but also giving you useful facts for
your better life in this particular era. So now let us demonstrate the relaxing pattern at this point is your body
and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning an activity. Do you want to
try this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Haydee Todd:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information easier to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, paper, book, and soon. You can
view that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. Typically the book that recommended to



you is We Were Feminists Once: From Riot Grrrl to CoverGirl®, the Buying and Selling of a Political
Movement this e-book consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This book was
represented how does the world has grown up. The language styles that writer value to explain it is easy to
understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this book suitable
all of you.
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