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For thirty years, Roy Underhill's PBS program, The Woodwright's Shop, has brought classic hand-tool
craftsmanship to viewers across America. Now, in his seventh book, Roy shows how to engage the mysteries
of the splitting wedge and the cutting edge to shape wood from forest to furniture.

Beginning with the standing tree, each chapter of The Woodwright's Guide explores one of nine trades of
woodcraft: faller, countryman and cleaver, hewer, log-builder, sawyer, carpenter, joiner, turner, and
cabinetmaker. Each trade brings new tools and techniques; each trade uses a different character of material;
but all are united by the grain in the wood and the enduring mastery of muscle and steel.

Hundreds of detailed drawings by Eleanor Underhill (Roy's daughter) illustrate the hand tools and processes
for shaping and joining wood. A special concluding section contains detailed plans for making your own
foot-powered lathes, workbenches, shaving horses, and taps and dies for wooden screws.

The Woodwright's Guide is informed by a lifetime of experience and study. A former master craftsman at
Colonial Williamsburg, Roy has inspired millions to "just say no to power tools" through his continuing
work as a historian, craftsman, activist, and teacher. In The Woodwright's Guide, he takes readers on a
personal journey through a legacy of off-the-grid, self-reliant craftsmanship. It's a toolbox filled with insight
and technique as well as wisdom and confidence for the artisan in all of us.
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From reader reviews:

Sybil Moore:

Within other case, little men and women like to read book The Woodwright's Guide: Working Wood with
Wedge and Edge. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about
how is important a book The Woodwright's Guide: Working Wood with Wedge and Edge. You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world with a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can
recognize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you will end up known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or perhaps
searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to the
library. Let's go through.

Tommy Cowen:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to decide on book like
comic, short story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not hoping The Woodwright's Guide: Working
Wood with Wedge and Edge that give your fun preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book.
Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the means for people to know world considerably better
then how they react to the world. It can't be said constantly that reading routine only for the geeky individual
but for all of you who wants to become success person. So , for every you who want to start studying as your
good habit, you can pick The Woodwright's Guide: Working Wood with Wedge and Edge become your
starter.

Sammy Cheney:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray anyone, why because this The Woodwright's Guide: Working Wood
with Wedge and Edge e-book written by well-known writer we are excited for well how to make book that
can be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking
every ideas and writing skill only for eliminate your hunger then you still uncertainty The Woodwright's
Guide: Working Wood with Wedge and Edge as good book not merely by the cover but also by content. This
is one publication that can break don't judge book by its handle, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this particular!? Oh come on your examining sixth sense already said so why you have to
listening to a different sixth sense.

Frank Tye:

Many people spending their period by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just watching
TV the entire day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It alright you can
have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like The Woodwright's Guide:
Working Wood with Wedge and Edge which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
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