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This Heal Your Inner Child subliminal solfeggio program - 639 Hz, 417 Hz - was designed to assist the
listener in gaining perception and energy alignment related to healing the inner child, releasing emotional
baggage from the past, and attending to unmet childhood needs.

This listening resource uses a combination of subliminal affirmations as well as sight-specific solfeggio
frequencies. Each topic tends to be associated with certain energy centers (chakras) of the body. For
example, topics related to forgiveness and love tend to be related to the heart chakra. Therefore the solfeggio
frequencies, induction, and affirmations of that particular program will all be related to the heart chakra. The
intention of this is to give the listener an integrated healing or expanding experience within the mind, body,
and spirit through sympathetic vibration.

The first chapter is geared toward listeners who prefer a more interactive experience, as it features a
meditative introduction, slightly audible affirmations, and a meditative conclusion. The second chapter
features simply solfeggio frequencies with subliminal affirmations for those who prefer a more ambient or
passive experience (to sleep, zone out, or listen to in the background). The third and fourth chapters feature
in-depth overviews of the program and specific solfeggio/chakra descriptions. The fifth, final chapter
features a new sleep induction track with white noise, sure to send you off to a peaceful night's rest.

When we become mindful of where we choose to place our attention, we become the masters of our own
inner experiences. So sit back, relax, and enjoy the infusion of sacred sound, Eastern philosophy, and
Western psychology with Subliminal Solfeggios!

Please note that this resource is not intended to diagnose, prevent, or treat any disease or illness. It is always
advisable to seek help from a qualified health provider in the event of mental or physical illness.
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From reader reviews:

Allison Phelps:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by talk with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Heal Your Inner Child, Reconcile & Mend
Childhood Wounds: Chakra Guided Meditation, Solfeggio Frequencies & Subliminal Affirmations -
Solfeggio Subliminals book since this book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the information
in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Timothy Hawkins:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information today can get by anyone in everywhere.
The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider while
those information which is inside the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Heal Your Inner Child, Reconcile & Mend Childhood
Wounds: Chakra Guided Meditation, Solfeggio Frequencies & Subliminal Affirmations - Solfeggio
Subliminals as the daily resource information.

Angel Martinez:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a publication will give you a lot of new
facts. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fictional works book the author will bring someone to
imagine the story how the figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other folks. When
you read this Heal Your Inner Child, Reconcile & Mend Childhood Wounds: Chakra Guided Meditation,
Solfeggio Frequencies & Subliminal Affirmations - Solfeggio Subliminals, you are able to tells your family,
friends as well as soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a
guide.

Bonnie Pace:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from it. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is published or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of news. On this
modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social including



newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh and comic. You can add your
knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just seeking the
Heal Your Inner Child, Reconcile & Mend Childhood Wounds: Chakra Guided Meditation, Solfeggio
Frequencies & Subliminal Affirmations - Solfeggio Subliminals when you needed it?
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