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China is one of the largest countries in the world, covering 7% of the earth's land surface, and encompassing
a hugely diverse range of habitats. As a result it boasts a rich and diverse avifauna, including some of the
most spectacular and fascinating birds to be found anywhere in the world. John MacKinnon and Karen
Phillipps' important new guide will be the first truly comprehensive, taxonomically modern, and fully
illustrated field guide to the birds of China. Over 1300 bird species are illustrated in 128 original colour
paintings, by Karen Phillipps and Dave Showler. The species accounts stress the key points for field
recognition and give a full description of the plumage, voice, range, distribution, status, and behavioral
characteristics for every bird, with additional descriptions provided for hundreds of subspecies. Colour
distribution maps are provided for all illustrated species. The book also includes a useful introductory section
that presents a background to the ecology of China, a brief history of Chinese ornithology, and plenty of
practical hints on birdwatching in China. The guide's portable format means it will fit easily into a backpack
or pocket. John MacKinnon lived in China and Hong Kong for eight years, and has extensive experience of
watching and writing about Chinese birds. He has been working in ecology and conservation in Asia for over
30 years, and his work in China included co-authoring the master plan to save the Giant Panda and its
habitat. He has written and co-authored many books on the natural history of Asia, including a number of
other bird guides. Karen Phillipps was born in Borneo, lived in Hong Kong for over 20 years, and has
illustrated several other books on the birdlife of the region.
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From reader reviews:

Dixie Love:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular
information inside the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get
based on what kind of e-book you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with training books but if
you want really feel happy read one using theme for entertaining like comic or novel. Often the A Field
Guide to the Birds of China is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unstable experience.

Pearl Dyson:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, small story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting A Field Guide to the Birds
of China that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book. Reading practice
all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world much better then how they react to
the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading habit only for the geeky individual but for all of you
who wants to always be success person. So , for every you who want to start looking at as your good habit,
you could pick A Field Guide to the Birds of China become your starter.

Marcia Marshall:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside with friends, fun activity having family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, ya
think reading a book can actually hard because you have to use the book everywhere? It okay you can have
the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like A Field Guide to the Birds of China
which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.

Florence Ross:

Do you like reading a reserve? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some people
likes reading, not only science book but additionally novel and A Field Guide to the Birds of China as well
as others sources were given information for you. After you know how the truly great a book, you feel desire
to read more and more. Science e-book was created for teacher as well as students especially. Those ebooks
are helping them to put their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes A Field
Guide to the Birds of China to make your spare time more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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