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If you love the stepbrother romances of Sabrina Paige, Caitlin Daire, and Krista Lakes, you’ll fall
hard for Laura Marie Altom’s tale of forbidden love—a red-hot novel in her Shamed series featuring
two tortured souls with an unbreakable bond.
 
As the chief legal counsel for dot-com billionaire Liam Stone, Garrett Marsden has grown accustomed to
being universally loathed. In fact, he welcomes it. Because the bigger the fight, the easier it is to run from his
desire for someone he can never have: his stepsister. But when Garrett flies back to Julep, Mississippi, for
Savannah’s med school graduation, a steamy encounter makes all his wildest dreams come true—and leads
to his undoing. Because that’s when he meets Savannah’s boyfriend. . . .
 
Five years later, Savannah Boudreaux couldn’t be happier as a small-town Southern doctor and single mom
to a young son. There’s only one thing missing. Her stepbrother, Garrett, has just been released from prison,
and although he may be a free man, he’s become a bitter shadow of the kind and caring man who once came
to her rescue. Now Savannah will cross the line to save Garrett from himself: to prove that he can live his
life, love whoever he wants . . . and be a wonderful father to their son.
 
Praise for Stepping Over the Line
 
“Laura Marie Altom definitely knows how to write a hero to die for. Strong, sexy and with a no-holds-barred
attitude, Garrett Marsden takes sizzle to a whole new level.”—New York Times bestselling author Tracy
Wolff

“Stepping Over the Line is a sexy, fast-paced story of forbidden love and a hero determined to win the
woman of his dreams. Despite every obstacle put in his way, Garrett wins Savannah with equal parts dirty
talk and tenderness. I loved this sizzling romance!”—New York Times bestselling author Virna DePaul

“Laura Marie Altom creates stories full of passion and angst, easily winning readers over with lovable
characters and steamy chemistry. Stepping Over the Line will have you turning pages quickly, eager to find
out what happens next!”—Sarah Robinson, author of the Kavanagh Legends series

“A gritty love story between a stepbrother and stepsister . . . Love the ending.”—Sportochick’s Musings
 
“I loved Garrett and I liked this book.”—A Crazy Vermonter’s Book Reviews

Includes a special message from the editor, as well as an excerpt from another Loveswept title.
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From reader reviews:

Joshua Little:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, going to beach, or
picnic from the park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book may be option to fill your free
time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of book that you should read. If you want to
try look for book, may be the e-book untitled Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother Novel (Shamed) can be
great book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Jeffrey Call:

This Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother Novel (Shamed) is great publication for you because the content
which is full of information for you who all always deal with world and possess to make decision every
minute. This specific book reveal it info accurately using great coordinate word or we can claim no rambling
sentences inside. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it
only will give you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with attractive delivering
sentences. Having Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother Novel (Shamed) in your hand like getting the
world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no reserve that offer you
world in ten or fifteen tiny right but this e-book already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hello
Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt that will?

Alice Concannon:

Is it anyone who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by simply watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother
Novel (Shamed) can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have
than the others?

John Smith:

Book is one of source of information. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the up-date information of year for you to year. As we
know those books have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. Through the book Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother Novel (Shamed) we can have more
advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative person must choose to read a book. Just choose
the best book that acceptable with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this book
Stepping Over the Line: A Stepbrother Novel (Shamed). You can more attractive than now.
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