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After several years as a small-town lawyer in Alpena, Frank J. Kelley was unexpectedly appointed
Michigan's attorney general at the end of 1961. He never suspected that he would continue to serve until
1999, a national record. During that time, he worked with everyone from John and Bobby Kennedy to Bill
Clinton and jump-started the careers of dozens of politicians and public figures, including U.S. Senator Carl
Levin and Governors James Blanchard and Jennifer Granholm. In The People's Lawyer: The Life and Times
of Frank J. Kelley, the Nation's Longest-Serving Attorney General, Kelley and co-author Jack Lessenberry
reflect on the personal and professional journey of the so-called godfather of the Michigan Democratic Party
during his incredible life and thirty-seven years in office.

The People's Lawyer chronicles Kelley's early life as the son of second-generation Irish immigrants, whose
father, Frank E. Kelley, started out as a Detroit saloon keeper and became a respected Democratic Party
leader. Kelley tells of becoming the first of his family to go to college and law school, his early days as a
lawyer in northern Michigan, and how he transformed the office of attorney general as an active crusader for
the people. Among other accomplishments, Kelley describes establishing the first Office of Consumer
Protection in the country, taking on Michigan's public utility companies, helping to end racially restrictive
real estate practices, and helping to initiate the multibillion-dollar Tobacco Master Settlement Agreement in
1998.

Kelley frames his work against a backdrop of the social and political upheaval of his times, including the
1967 Detroit riots, the disappearance of Jimmy Hoffa, and the assassinations of John F. Kennedy, Robert F.
Kennedy, and Martin Luther King, Jr. All those interested in American history and legal history will enjoy
this highly readable, entertaining account of Kelley's life of public service.
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From reader reviews:

Norma Lorentzen:

Book is definitely written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can learn everything you want by a e-
book. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A e-book The People's Lawyer: The Life and
Times of Frank J. Kelley, the Nation's Longest-Serving Attorney General (Painted Turtle) will make you to
always be smarter. You can feel much more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some
of you think that open or reading the book make you bored. It is not make you fun. Why they could be
thought like that? Have you searching for best book or ideal book with you?

George Thomas:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try and
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't work here is
difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the outside search
likes. Maybe you answer might be The People's Lawyer: The Life and Times of Frank J. Kelley, the Nation's
Longest-Serving Attorney General (Painted Turtle) why because the amazing cover that make you consider
concerning the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content is fantastic as the outside as well as
cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Deborah Young:

On this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more
treasured than other. Do you want to become one among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you
should do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of
many books in the top collection in your reading list is actually The People's Lawyer: The Life and Times of
Frank J. Kelley, the Nation's Longest-Serving Attorney General (Painted Turtle). This book that is qualified
as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.

Jasper Parsons:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or to
make summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's soul or real their
hobby. They just do what the professor want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to
reach Chinese's country. So , this The People's Lawyer: The Life and Times of Frank J. Kelley, the Nation's
Longest-Serving Attorney General (Painted Turtle) can make you experience more interested to read.
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