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Take your game development skills to the next level with this practical and robust guide

About This Book

Build an entire AAA game level throughout the book●

Take your C++ scripting skills to the next level and use them extensively to build the game●

An advanced practical guide with a tutorial style approach that will help you make the best of Unreal●

engine 4

Who This Book Is For

This book is for game developers who have a basic knowledge of Unreal Engine and C++ scripting
knowledge. If you want to take the leap from a casual game developer to a full-fledged professional game
developer with Unreal Engine 4, this is the book for you.

What You Will Learn

Script your player controls in C++●

Build a superb and engaging level with advanced design techniques●

Program AI with C++●

Use Cascade to add life to your games●

Use custom shaders and advanced shading techniques to make things pretty●

Implement an awesome UI in the game●

Control gameplay using data tables●

In Detail

Unreal Engine 4 has garnered a lot of attention in the gaming world because of its new and improved
graphics and rendering engine, the physics simulator, particle generator, and more. This book is the ideal
guide to help you leverage all these features to create state-of-the-art games.

We will explain advanced shaders and effects techniques and how you can implement them in your games.
You’ll create custom lighting effects, use the physics simulator to add that extra edge to your games, and
create customized game environments that look visually stunning using the rendering technique. You’ll find
out how to use the new rendering engine efficiently, add amazing post-processing effects, and use data tables
to create data-driven gameplay that is engaging and exciting.

By the end of this book, you will be able to create professional games with stunning graphics using Unreal
Engine 4.
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From reader reviews:

Sam Stenger:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the book entitled Mastering Unreal Engine 4.X. Try to face the book Mastering
Unreal Engine 4.X as your close friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you feel alone and
beside regarding course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The book makes
you more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience
and also knowledge with this book.

Melvin Dove:

The book Mastering Unreal Engine 4.X gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
utilize to make your capable far more increase. Book can to become your best friend when you getting
anxiety or having big problem with the subject. If you can make reading a book Mastering Unreal Engine
4.X being your habit, you can get far more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your
knowledge about a number of or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like wide open and read
a reserve Mastering Unreal Engine 4.X. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science reserve or
encyclopedia or other people. So , how do you think about this publication?

Richard Vedder:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared to
can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because all of this time you only find book that need more
time to be examine. Mastering Unreal Engine 4.X can be your answer given it can be read by you who have
those short time problems.

Craig Rushing:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Mastering Unreal Engine 4.X
which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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