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Frustrated in love and sex and unsure what to do with his life, young Nelson Leatherby sets out from his
home town of Durban, South Africa, to start a new life in England.

Before he leaves, he sells his prize possessions—his beloved Triumph motorcycle and old Rover 90—to
Rafferty Farnsworth, a bon vivant who doesn’t always have the best of intentions…and who will eventually
put Leatherby’s very life in danger.

Installed in his new life in London, Leatherby sets out to transform himself into an English gentleman. He
acquires a job with a shipping company, moves into a flat next to two gorgeous and alluring women, and sets
out find his place in the upper echelons of society—and vanquish his sexual frustration.

Everything goes according to plan until Rafferty shows up with an angry mafia Don on his trail. Suddenly,
Leatherby finds himself running for his life in the company of Camille, an extraordinary and beautiful
woman.

Full of sex, lies, intrigue, art theft, stolen identities, and all the other hallmarks of a great caper, Lord Souffle
is a rollicking adventure that takes readers from Durban’s sunny beaches to high society London and back
again.
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From reader reviews:

Tommie Payton:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the subject Lord Souffle
(Leatherby) (Volume 1) suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well-known writer in this era.
Typically the book untitled Lord Souffle (Leatherby) (Volume 1)is one of several books which everyone
read now. This book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this guide you will enter
the new way of measuring that you ever know previous to. The author explained their idea in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a wide
range of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this particular
book.

Troy Jones:

Is it a person who having spare time in that case spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Lord Souffle (Leatherby) (Volume 1) can
be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by
reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?

Rhonda Yowell:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or even
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's spirit or real
their hobby. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading critically. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on
this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Lord Souffle (Leatherby) (Volume 1) can make you really feel more interested to read.

Anthony Wood:

Some individuals said that they feel bored when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt that when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose the particular book Lord Souffle (Leatherby) (Volume 1) to
make your personal reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading proficiency is developing
when you like reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the
sensation about book and studying especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to open a book and
learn it. Beside that the reserve Lord Souffle (Leatherby) (Volume 1) can to be a newly purchased friend
when you're sense alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of these time.
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