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Up front, we are introduced to Parr through an episode one evening at restaurant Michael Mina, when a
couple came in with a special bottle in a paper bag and asked Parr to identify it. He tried to beg off because
of a lingering cold. The customers insisted, and so with only a sniff, he correctly called it as a Volnay
Premier Cru Burgundy, and after one sip, as a 1998. As it turned out, he also had the producer in his head,
though the bottle was revealed before he spoke. As the book suggests, just imagine what Parr might be like
with his full game on. Credentials established, the book moves through the world of the sommelier from
almost every angle: the development of the role historically, capsules on modern-day pioneer sommeliers
who redefined the profession and fine wine lists, service essentials, storage and serving temperatures, buying
strategies and tasting notes. Some sections, like the short, pithy section on wine and food pairing, are fresh
and insightful. Parr draws some nifty distinctions between different preparations of the same chunk of
protein, and offers a promising solution to the age-old riddle of what goes with soup and with fried foods:
Champagne. A central focus is on how to taste, and how to get better at tasting. As you might expect,
rigorous practice is the key, and the more years of it the better. In case you thought this would be easy, Parr
suggests drinking only one kind of wine for a month or two, in all price ranges, from every region, until that
grape's character is burned into your head; and then pick another one. His suggestions of iconic and
benchmark wines that define certain grapes and regions sound right on the money to me, with an emphasis
on the money part: many of the listed bottles -- great Burgundies and Bordeaux, for example -- carry a bottle
cost higher than most people's idea of a good case price...
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From reader reviews:

Concepcion Maldonado:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students because they are still students or that for all people
in the world, the actual best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every
person has various personality and hobby per other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't wish do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Secrets of the Sommeliers: How
to Think and Drink Like the World's Top Wine Professionals by Parr, Rajat, Mackay, Jordan (2010)
Hardcover. All type of book can you see on many solutions. You can look for the internet solutions or other
social media.

Freddie Patton:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive right now, people have
do something to make all of them survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice by
means of surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the item for a while is
reading. Yes, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to remain than other is high.
For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Secrets of the Sommeliers: How
to Think and Drink Like the World's Top Wine Professionals by Parr, Rajat, Mackay, Jordan (2010)
Hardcover book as starter and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Jacob Florence:

This book untitled Secrets of the Sommeliers: How to Think and Drink Like the World's Top Wine
Professionals by Parr, Rajat, Mackay, Jordan (2010) Hardcover to be one of several books that will best
seller in this year, that is because when you read this e-book you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will easily
to buy this specific book in the book shop or you can order it by way of online. The publisher on this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell phone. So
there is no reason to you personally to past this book from your list.

Jennifer Meeks:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year
seemed to be exactly added. This guide Secrets of the Sommeliers: How to Think and Drink Like the
World's Top Wine Professionals by Parr, Rajat, Mackay, Jordan (2010) Hardcover was filled in relation to
science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has several
feel when they reading the book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can experience enjoy to
read a publication. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you simply wanted.
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