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How to be a glam grrl with money in the bank, the heart of a lion, and the passion to make your dreams come
true. . .

Loving one's weirdness (which Godfrey calls the fingerprint of the soul), getting loud (without apology),
using money to exercise voice (while defying materialism), asking forgiveness (when permission has been
skirted), are just a few of the secrets which open the door to the indie grrl's real life.

Not your standard how-to book, Godfrey uses the lives of REAL indie women to uncover secrets that make
them memorable and individual. At the heart of Godfrey's stories are instructions that help Y-Gen femmes
find their voice, get and use money for their own visions and dreams, and help them gain comfort inside their
own unique skins. Independent women, according to Godfrey, are not "lone wolves" but are independent
while in the middle of love, friendship, and family.

Geeks and girlygirls, surferchicks and soccerjocks, prom queens and poets, wild things and intellects-all
femmes en route to claiming their own womanself will find the $ecrets divulged herein, of use on their
journey. And added to the fun and function of the book are activities and events that readers can use to go
deeper-either on-line or in real time.

The founder of Independent Means, Inc., a company which produces such programs as Camp $tart-Up (a
summer business program for Y-Gen women) and The DollarDiva's MoneyFair, as well as products like Hot
Company( and Women Who Dare(, Godfrey's ideas emerge from her deep experience and work with the
independent women whose daring and original management of their own lives are changing the very nature
of the work/life conundrum.
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From reader reviews:

Johnny Mosier:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their very own spare time to take a
move, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book called 20 Secrets to
Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic Empowerment, and Self-Awareness? Maybe
it is for being best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's
book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have various other opinion?

Terry Grissom:

This 20 Secrets to Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic Empowerment, and Self-
Awareness book is just not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you
will get by reading this book is actually information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get details
which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This kind of 20 Secrets to Money and
Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic Empowerment, and Self-Awareness without we realize
teach the one who reading it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry 20 Secrets to
Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic Empowerment, and Self-Awareness can
bring when you are and not make your tote space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in the
lovely laptop even cell phone. This 20 Secrets to Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence,
Economic Empowerment, and Self-Awareness having great arrangement in word and also layout, so you will
not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Hubert Wooten:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the free time or they will get
lots of stress from both everyday life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely without a doubt. People is human not just a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading ebooks. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, typically the book
you have read will be 20 Secrets to Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic
Empowerment, and Self-Awareness.

Patricia Whetsel:

Don't be worry should you be afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This 20 Secrets to Money and Independence: A
Guide to Independence, Economic Empowerment, and Self-Awareness can give you a lot of friends because
by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they don't and make you more like an interesting
person. That book can be one of a step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that probably



your friend doesn't know, by knowing more than various other make you to be great persons. So , why
hesitate? Let's have 20 Secrets to Money and Independence: A Guide to Independence, Economic
Empowerment, and Self-Awareness.
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