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M. R. James (1862-1936) is probably best remembered as a writer of chilling ghost stories, but he was an
outstanding scholar of medieval literature and palaeography, who served both as Provost of King's College,
Cambridge, and as Director of the Fitzwilliam Museum, and many of his stories reflect his academic
background. His detailed descriptive catalogues of manuscripts owned by colleges, cathedrals and museums
are still of value to scholars today. This volume contains James's catalogue of the manuscript holdings of the
Fitzwilliam Museum, and will be welcomed by librarians and researchers alike.
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From reader reviews:

Jamie Lundquist:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read the
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the whole day to
reading a guide. The book A Descriptive Catalogue of the Manuscripts in the Fitzwilliam Museum: With
Introduction and Indices (Cambridge Library Collection - History of Printing, Publishing and Libraries) it is
very good to read. There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading
this book. When you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You
can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book offers
high quality.

Daniel Nelson:

The book untitled A Descriptive Catalogue of the Manuscripts in the Fitzwilliam Museum: With
Introduction and Indices (Cambridge Library Collection - History of Printing, Publishing and Libraries)
contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains her idea with easy approach. The language is
very clear to see all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was written
by famous author. The author will take you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read this book
because you can continue reading your smart phone, or product, so you can read the book in anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open up their official web-site as well as order it. Have a
nice examine.

Carolyn Wilson:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This specific A Descriptive Catalogue of the Manuscripts in the
Fitzwilliam Museum: With Introduction and Indices (Cambridge Library Collection - History of Printing,
Publishing and Libraries) can give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you
have thing that they don't and make a person more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of
a step for you to get success. This publication offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't
understand, by knowing more than additional make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We
should have A Descriptive Catalogue of the Manuscripts in the Fitzwilliam Museum: With Introduction and
Indices (Cambridge Library Collection - History of Printing, Publishing and Libraries).

Phillip Vargas:

Do you like reading a publication? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book seemed to be



rare? Why so many question for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy regarding reading.
Some people likes reading, not only science book and also novel and A Descriptive Catalogue of the
Manuscripts in the Fitzwilliam Museum: With Introduction and Indices (Cambridge Library Collection -
History of Printing, Publishing and Libraries) or even others sources were given knowledge for you. After
you know how the great a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science guide was created for
teacher or perhaps students especially. Those guides are helping them to increase their knowledge. In
different case, beside science e-book, any other book likes A Descriptive Catalogue of the Manuscripts in the
Fitzwilliam Museum: With Introduction and Indices (Cambridge Library Collection - History of Printing,
Publishing and Libraries) to make your spare time far more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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