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This volume commemorates the life, work, and foundational views of Kurt Gödel (1906-1978), most famous
for his hallmark works on the completeness of first-order logic, the incompleteness of number theory, and
the consistency - with the other widely accepted axioms of set theory - of the axiom of choice and of the
generalized continuum hypothesis. It explores current research, advances, and ideas for future directions not
only in the foundations of mathematics and logic, but also in the fields of computer science, artificial
intelligence, physics, cosmology, philosophy, theology, and the history of science. The discussion is
supplemented by personal reflections from several scholars who knew Gödel personally, providing some
interesting insights into his life. By putting his ideas and life's work into the context of current thinking and
perceptions, this book will extend the impact of Gödel's fundamental work in mathematics, logic,
philosophy, and other disciplines for future generations of researchers.
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From reader reviews:

Georgianna Menendez:

This Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics: Horizons of Truth tend to be reliable for you who
want to be a successful person, why. The reason of this Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics:
Horizons of Truth can be on the list of great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
looking at food but feed a person with information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This
book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions in e-book and
printed ones. Beside that this Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics: Horizons of Truth giving you
an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we
understand it useful in your day action. So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Barbara Watson:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their particular friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, likely to beach,
or picnic inside park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to
something different to fill your own free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book might be option to fill your
free time/ holiday. The first thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to consider look for book, may be the book untitled Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics:
Horizons of Truth can be great book to read. May be it may be best activity to you.

Nancy Harris:

Beside this kind of Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics: Horizons of Truth in your phone, it can
give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or information. The information and the knowledge you
will got here is fresh from the oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an older people live in narrow
small town. It is good thing to have Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics: Horizons of Truth
because this book offers to your account readable information. Do you often have book but you do not get
what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that will not end up to happen if you have this in your hand. The
Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss
it? Find this book and read it from right now!

James Harris:

A lot of guide has printed but it is unique. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever simply by searching from it. It is known
as of book Kurt Gödel and the Foundations of Mathematics: Horizons of Truth. Contain your knowledge by
it. Without departing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one location to other place.
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