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This Broadside will look at the changes that can be made to halt the full implementation of the law over the
next few years, including repealing parts of the act that are unpopular with members of both parties. These
parts are the medical device tax, IPAB, the new 3.8 percent tax on unearned income, to name a few.

Also covered will be potential reforms to Medicare and Medicaid, two major entitlement programs that, if
not reformed to ensure sustainability for those who really need these programs, will be bankrupt by 2024.
There are a number of important lawsuits that will come before the courts this year on issues such as the
exchanges, employer and individual mandates, and the contraception mandate. These will be highlighted and
their potential impact on the law will be discussed.

Finally, there is the issue of defunding the Medicaid expansion and the federal tax subsidies which, unless
changed, will add tremendously to the cost of health care in this country. With the current fiscal crisis, these
programs must be scaled back.

Like welfare reform, the battle to bring about meaningful health care reform is a long-term fight. We must
not give up. The election of 2016 will be very important for the future direction of health care. A reform plan
will be offered. If Obamacare is not repealed and replaced, the U.S. will be on the road to a single-payer,
“Medicare for All” system such as exists in Canada. We, too, will face long waiting lists, rationed care, and a
lack of access to the latest technology and treatments. Examples will be given. America will be on the “Road
to Serfdom” and there will be no off-ramp.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hall:

Many people spending their period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It all right
you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like The Cure for
Obamacare (Encounter Broadsides) which is obtaining the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's see.

Cornell Warren:

This The Cure for Obamacare (Encounter Broadsides) is brand new way for you who has interest to look for
some information since it relief your hunger associated with. Getting deeper you onto it getting knowledge
more you know or perhaps you who still having little bit of digest in reading this The Cure for Obamacare
(Encounter Broadsides) can be the light food for yourself because the information inside this book is easy to
get simply by anyone. These books build itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the
e-book type. People who think that in e-book form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer.
So there is no in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be
here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book variety for your better life in addition to
knowledge.

Ethelyn Allen:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This specific book The Cure for Obamacare (Encounter Broadsides)
was colorful and of course has pictures around. As we know that book The Cure for Obamacare (Encounter
Broadsides) has many kinds or style. Start from kids until young adults. For example Naruto or Investigation
company Conan you can read and believe that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are
make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book to suit your
needs and try to like reading in which.

Violet Iverson:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs from the others. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the top book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is identified as of
book The Cure for Obamacare (Encounter Broadsides). You can contribute your knowledge by it. Without
causing the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most critical
that, you must aware about reserve. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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