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Fifty years after Oscar Lewis's famous depiction of five Mexican families caught in a "culture of poverty,"
Caroline Moser tells a very different story of five neighborhood women and their families strategically
accumulating assets to escape poverty in the Ecuadoran city of Guayaquil. In Ordinary Families,
Extraordinary Lives, Moser shows how a more sophisticated understanding of the complexities of asset
accumulation as well as poverty itself can help counter inaccurate stereotypes about global poverty. It
provides invaluable insight into strategies that may help people in developing countries improve their
wellbeing.

The similar socioeconomic characteristics and economic circumstances of the Guayaquil families in 1978,
when Moser began her research, set the stage for a natural experiment. By 2004, these circumstances varied
widely. Moser captures the causes and consequences of these developments through economic data,
anthropological narrative, and personal photos. She then places this compelling story within the broader
context of political, economic, and spatial changes in Guayaquil and Ecuador.

Moser describes how households in a Third World urban slum relentlessly and systematically fought to
accumulate human, social, and financial capital assets. Her longitudinal account of their odyssey captures
long-term trends and changes in perception that are missed in snapshot assessments. Chapters in this holistic
story cover diverse issues such as housing and infrastructure, community mobilization and political
negotiation, employment, family dynamics, violence, and emigration.
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From reader reviews:

Hans Diaz:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive now, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and
notice by simply surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Ordinary Families,
Extraordinary Lives: Assets and Poverty Reduction in Guayaquil, 1978-2004 book as starter and daily
reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Michelle Sanders:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give you lot
of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge your information inside the book that improve
your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of e-book you read, if you
want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want sense happy read one with theme for
entertaining for instance comic or novel. Typically the Ordinary Families, Extraordinary Lives: Assets and
Poverty Reduction in Guayaquil, 1978-2004 is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable
experience.

Charles Anthony:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a guide we can know
everything we would like. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This guide Ordinary Families, Extraordinary Lives: Assets and Poverty Reduction in
Guayaquil, 1978-2004 was filled with regards to science. Spend your free time to add your knowledge about
your scientific disciplines competence. Some people has different feel when they reading a new book. If you
know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like right
now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Gary Spengler:

As a university student exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library as
well as to make summary for some publication, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their interest. They just do what the professor want, like asked to go to the library.
They go to generally there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that studying is not
important, boring and also can't see colorful pics on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very
important to suit your needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like.
Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Ordinary Families, Extraordinary Lives:
Assets and Poverty Reduction in Guayaquil, 1978-2004 can make you really feel more interested to read.
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